
Lois Goodwin — 252-225-5881

Cedar Island

Friends of Down East
Lib Ferebee — 252-732-0800

Food Help
A wonderful project is 

under way: a spread sheet 
which lists every place in 
Carteret County to find 
food being provided for 
those in need. A letter sent 
to churches recently said: 
“Thank you for all you do 
for our hungry citizens and 
your faith com- munity 
in Carteret County. We at 
Food Secure Carteret have 
collected data about where 
hungry people can find 
pantry food or meals and 
where volunteers can be 
helpful; we work very hard 
to keep it super current.”

 “We need your help 
promoting this mega 
spreadsheet of data. 
Click on the webpage 
CrystalCoastNonprofits.
org to find the red but-

ton FOOD HELP and click 
on that red button to see 
the most current data we 
can find… Or find Crystal 
Coast Nonprofit Network’s 
Facebook page and share 
our red button from there.” 

In this letter written by 
Catherine Elkins, she also 
says, “You may wish to 
copy and print parts of this 
spreadsheet for your needs 
- go right ahead. Let us 
know if you have sugges-
tions, additions, or want 
to join our ZOOM meet-
ings (4th Thursdays at 8:30 
a.m.)

Thanks for your help 
in this effort to reduce 
food insecurity in Carteret 
County.” 

Catherine Elkins, 252-
515-4799 foodhelpcarteret
county@gmail.com

Find it OFF Line?
This is a problem that 

worries me. How many 
people are being left out 
because they don’t have 
access to the internet? Even 
the county and the libraries 
put info online and figure 
everyone will see it. 

If you are interested 
in this very useful list of 
places to find help for 
friends going through hard 
times, or wondering how 
and where, you can help by 
giving time or donations, I 
can only suggest that you 
call Catherine Elkins at the 
number above or Carteret 
Local Food Network at 
252-777- 2359. 

You are also welcome 
to call me, Lib on my cell 
phone number shown in 

the heading. I welcome 
any ideas on how civic 
groups can reach folks who 
don’t use computers. You 
can also call me about any 
good causes that deserve 
mention here in our col-
umn. Or send them to 
friendsofdowneast@gmail.
com 

At the Library
Down East Library does 

have free computer use 
during open hours and 24/7 
public WiFi. 

Open hours are Mon. 
Wed. and Friday from 9 to 
5:30. Phone during those 
hours 252 648 7729 to ask 
a question or order a book 
with your library card num-
ber. Don’t forget: movies 
and eBooks are also avail-
able!
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Abbi Davis — 252-241-4549

Harkers Island

Julie West — 252-725-3762

Smyrna-Williston

The Boy Scout troop 
in Davis is selling candy 
bars again this year to raise 
money for summer camp. 
Please see your local troop 
members for any candy 
orders. I know that Sherry 
Stott is selling for them.

The Girl Scout troops on 
Cedar Island would like to 
thank everyone who pur-
chased cookies this year. 
The troop sold all out. Keep 
up the good works girls, we 
are proud of you.

A party was held for 
Easton Goodwin to celebrate 

his 4th birthday on Saturday 
the 20th. Easton received 
lots of gifts; His cake 
(Toy Story) was designed 
by Menzette Chadwick. 
Easton is the son of Corey 
and Amanda Goodwin, 
grandson of Lamar and 
PJ Castle and Lonnie and 
Annette Goodwin. Easton’s 
grandparents came from 
Greenville to help celebrate 
his birthday.

Easton and Mack have 
begun to play T-ball, they 
practice on Monday evening 
at Smyrna. Their first did 

not go very well for the two 
boys, they were scared of 
course, and the weather was 
very cold. Maybe the weeks 
ahead will be better for them 
both. Trying something new 
is always hard for everyone.

Ms. Gay Lupton has had 
some bad luck lately. Ms. 
Gay fell while trying to mop 
her floors in the house. She 
has broken some bones and 
has been hospitalized twice 
now for her injury. Please 
keep her in your prayer for 
comfort and healing.

Bobby Davis is getting 
ready for another surgery 
on arm April 9th. The injury 
was sustained during his 
accident in September of 
2020. Please keep him in 
your prayers.

Prayers List
Vickie Guthrie, Bobby 

Davis, Billy Jack Styron, 
Valeria Lewis, Carlton Day, 
Teresa Willis, Gay Lupton, 
Wendell Hunning, Jude 
Fulcher.

Birthday
Henry Goodwin, Brittany 

Wade, Charles L Styron, 

Sheri Styron, Madison 
Taylor, Anthony Johnson, 
Marshall Daniels, Ethan 
Gaskill, Davis W Gaskill, 
Davison Gaskill.

Anniversary
Roman and Angie 

Hryniszak, David, and Nina 
Gaskill.

Church News
The Free Will Baptist 

church worship service is 
at 11 a.m. Guest Speaker 
Rev. Kevin Stott. Everyone 
is Welcome!

The Methodist will have 
Sunday School starting 
today at 10, all precautions 
will be taken children and 
adults to wear their masks. 
Worship Service at 11 a.m.

Sunrise Service will be 
held at the Cedar Island 
Boat ramp next to the NC 
Ferry Docks. Time to be 
announced.

God Bless each of you 
and have a wonderful week.

The wind and the waves 
don’t scare him, nor the 
depths of the mighty sea, for 
he is a Core Sound fisher-
man, so strong and tough 
is he. 

In winter he walks and 
oysters and wades through 
many creeks, for he is a Core 
Sound fisherman, without 
him we’d not eat. 

In spring he watches blue 
crabs and waits for shedding 
to start, he’ll stay awake for 
days on end, because he is a 
Core Sound fisherman and 
this is a work of heart. 

The summer will be a hot 
one, the days drag on and 
on, but he is a Core Sound 
fisherman and fishing is his 
song. 

In fall the weather is 
favored, for hauling in the 

bay, a mullet run is what 
he needs to surely make his 
day. 

Whether it be setting crab 
pots, or draggin’ the forty-
four, he is a Core Sound 
fisherman, he feels it to his 
core. He works the long 
hard hours, he’ll even work 
at night, for he is a Core 
Sound fisherman, and fish-
ing is his right. 

Anytime you ever see 
one, be sure to shake his 
hand, it’ll probably be a 
tough one, for he’s a Core 
Sound man. So let him know 
you’re thankful, for fishing 
day and night, it’s more than 
just a job to him, he’s fight-
ing the good fight.

Milestones

Happy birthday to 
Linda Fairchild, Michael 
Davis, Emma Davis, Tia 
Best, Libby Yeomans, Jodi 
Willis, Bethany Carolina 
Michaels, Jack Ray Price, 
Darbi Ferguson and Mary 
West, today; Benji Taylor, 
Talisha Fulcher, Sonny 
Charles Rhu, Michael Kent 
Lawrence, Marlee Rochelle 
Smith, Aaron Bowen and 
Caleb Connely, Monday; 
and Michael Spencer, Celena 
Meg Brigman, Lisa Styron, 
Savannah Long and Maleah 
Shannon Smith, Tuesday. 
Also, Yvette Baker, Doug 
Guthrie, Jan Gillikin, Daniel 
Yeomans, Davison Bret 
Gaskill, Cecil Huneycutt, 
Marsha Yeomans and Steve 
Miller, Thursday; Randy 
Taylor, Sullivan Bates Tant, 
Rena Pearl Lawrence and 
Sky Murphy, Friday; and 
Alan Rose Jr., William 
O’Neal, David Gillikin, 
Andres Goodwin, Isaiah 
Smith, Jack Davis, Gracelyn 
Long and Wayne Guthrie 
Saturday.

Anniversaries
Anniversary wishes go out 

to Sue and Jeff Mason and 
Bobby and Judy Ensminger, 
Monday; Roger and Patricia 
“Tesey” Sparks, Tuesday; 
Lori Amber and Jeremy 
Goodwin and Andrew 
Brian and Marina Guthrie, 
Wednesday; Terry and June 
Gaskill, Friday; and Cheryl 

and Steve Chadwick, Darrell 
and Jackie WIllis and Keith 
and Christie Wall, Saturday.
Carrot Cake Pound 
Cake

For batter:
2 sticks salted butter; 

softened;2 cups sugar; 6 oz. 
cream cheese; softened ; 2 
teaspoons, vanilla extract; 
3 large eggs; 3 cups all 
purpose flour; ½ teaspoon 
baking powder; ½ teaspoon 
ground nutmeg; ½ teaspoon 
ground ginger; 1 teaspoon 
baking soda; 1 teaspoon 
salt; 2 teaspoon cinnamon; 
2 cups carrots, grated

For frosting:
2 oz. cream cheese, soft-

ened; 3 tablespoons brown 
sugar; 2 teaspoons milk.

Preheat oven to 350°F. 
Grease and flour a ten-inch 
bundt pan (I prefer to use 
Bakers Joy cooking spray). 
In a medium bowl, cream 
butter and sugar together; 
blend in cream cheese until 
smooth. Add in eggs and 
vanilla. In a separate bowl, 
sift dry ingredients and 
combine. Slowly add to egg 
mixture until combined. 
Fold in carrots and pour into 
cake pan and bake 1 hour 
or until done. For frosting, 
whip together cream cheese 
and sugar until blended well, 
add in milk and mix until 
smooth. Spoon over warm 
cake, serve and enjoy!

Well, did we have a false 
spring or what? The warm 
sunny days turned into cool-
er temperatures and yes, 
more rain. But don’t give up 
hope, Spring is coming!

Milestones 
Birthday wishes Julie 

Pittman and Angela Scott 
today; Jennie Austin, 
Courtney Braswell, Stacy 
Gillikin, Jonathan Murphy 
and Wanda Taylor, Monday; 
Veronica Conway and 
Robert Price, Tuesday; 
Ricky Sabiston, Thursday; 
Royal Hooper, Friday; Syd 
Stewart, Saturday. 

Anniversary
Anniversary greetings 

are sent to Tommy and 
Claudia Gillikin along with 
Charles and Kathy Siggler, 
Thursday;

  
Get well wishes and 

prayers are sent to Chelsey 
Adkins, Melanie Arthur, 
Jerry and Donna Lee Brown, 
Floyd Brown, Marshall 
Daniels, Heather Davis and 
Julia Dees.

Nicky Harvey, Charlie 
Inabnitt, Greg Lewis, Avon 
Nelson, Sherry Noulles, 
Frank Piner, 

Also, Kerry Robinson, 
Penny Rose, Charlie Scott, 
Wanda Styron, Derek 
Thompson, Cecil Tuten, 

Eden Van Etten, Cristy 
Crosswell Williams, Cathi 
Willis, Daphne Willis, 
Jeanette O. Willis, John 
Willis, Phyllis Willis, Susan 
Wesley Willis, Zelma Willis, 
Doug Young and Fern 
Young.

Remember them 
Remember those commu-

nity residents that are in our 
local extended-care facility: 
They are: Betty Gillikin, 
Kalani Gillikin and Mildred 
Piner.

Sympathy
Sincere sympathy is 

extended to the family of 
Almeta Gaskill of Harkers 
Island who passed away on 
Tuesday, March 16. Our 
thoughts and prayers are with 
the family during this time. 

Congratulations
Congratulations to Robert 

and Susan Hill of Williston, 
on the birth of their new 
granddaughter. Madelyn 
Susan Braun, was born on 
Saturday, March 6, at the 
Cleveland Clinic Fairview 
Park in Cleveland, Ohio. 
Madelyn weighed 8 pounds, 
6 ounces and was 20 inches 
long. Proud parents are Mike 
and Liz Hill Braun.

Monday lunch
The Hand 2 Hand Thrift 

Shop is having a Free lunch 
Monday, tomorrow, Monday, 
March 22 from 11 a.m. until 
2 p.m. Sloppy Joe’s is on the 
menu for tomorrow with a 
few extra treats. The Hand 2 
Hand Thrift Shop is located 
at 425 Highway 70, Smyrna 
and for more information or 
curb side service call 252-
418-0000.

Lodge meets
The Crissie Wright 

Lodge members in Smyrna 
have begun meeting again 
and resuming their regular 
scheduled meeting nights 
and times. The lodge meets 
the first the third Thursdays 
of each month, beginning at 
7 p.m. each evening. 

Scout Fundraiser
Friends of Scouting 

Down East will sponsor a 
Ham Dinner Fundraiser on 
Saturday, April 17, from 11 
a.m. until 2 p.m. Plates will 
include, Baked Ham, potato 
salad, green beans, roll and 
drink for a donation of $10 
per plate. This event will 
be held at the Davis Scout 
Center and will be drive 
through only! There will 
also be an open air bake sale 
under the picnic shelter! 


